



BID OPENING TABULATION SHEET

Date: May 16, 2018- 2:00 PM

Bid: BITUMINOUS CONCRETE FY 2019

Company Name	Type 1 F.O.B. Plant	In Place on Streets	Small Quantity	Hand work	Curb	Bid Bond	"A"	References	MHD Cert. Approval
Brox Industries, Inc. Dracut, MA 01826	\$70.00	\$67.75	\$138.50	\$145.00	\$4.85	X	X	X	X
Allied Paving Corporation Chelmsford, MA	No Bid	No Bid	\$119.00	\$137.00	\$5.20	X	X	X	X
Aggregate Industries Saugus, MA 01983	\$67.00	\$76.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	X	X	X	X
Sunshine Paving North Chelmsford, MA	No Bid	\$75.00	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$5.00	X	X	X	X
BitCon Corporation Topsfield, MA 01983	No Bid	\$66.75	\$120.00	\$145.00	\$4.75	X	X	X	X
D&R General Contracting, Inc. Melrose, MA	No Bid	\$65.45	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	X	X	X	X


 Date 5-16-18
 Date 5/16/18
 Date _____

Alan J. Benson, CPO, Town Administrator

 Susan L. Inman, Assistant to the Town Administrator